From: Brianna Fox <BFox@esconsult.net>

Sent: Wednesday, February 25, 2026 10:54 AM

To: Andrea Cinadr <andrea.cinadr@galionhealth.org>
Subject: Invoices

Hello Andrea,
Please see below for all open or past due invoices, in case they may have been overlooked or misplaced.

If you need a copy of any specific invoice, | will be glad to provide it. If you would like, | can help you get set up
our online payment portal, ConnectBooster. With ConnectBooster, you will be able to view and track all paid
and unpaid invoices, pay invoices, schedule payments, change payment information, and check your balance
along with many other helpful features.

Feel free to reach out with any questions or if you need additional information.
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Best Regards,
Bri Fox

PROCUREMENT AND REVENUE COORDINATOR
ES|CONSULTING, INC

419.756.1869
3849 PARK AVENUE WEST, ONTARIO, OH 44903
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Confidentiality Notice:

The information contained in this communication from ES|Consulting is confidential and is solely for the intended recipient(s) only. If you are not
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any retaining, disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in relation to the contents of
this information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately and then
delete it. If you do not wish to receive email messages from ES| Consulting, please notify the sender.

From: Andrea Cinadr <andrea.cinadr@galionhealth.org>
Sent: Thursday, February 26, 2026 9:44 AM

To: Brianna Fox <BFox@esconsult.net>

Subject: RE: Invoices

Brianna,

| am sorry about this. Some of these were misplaced. The 2022 invoices are bills that we are against
paying, because of all of the issues that occurred at that time were not our fault; | believe they are the
server migration issues. My fiscal employee found a few in her email that got overlooked from 2025. We
have completed a “Then & Now” purchase order and processed it to be paid by the city auditor’s office.

With the new year beginning, and a new auditor/city administration, there has been some delay in the
city paying some of our bills. They have assured us that this will get better. | apologize.

Sincerely,

Andrea Cinadr

Health Commissioner

Galion City Health Department
113 Harding Way East

Phone: 419-468-1075 ext. 1265
Cell: 419-989-3189

Fax: 419-468-8618

I
galion city

Confidentiality Notice: "This e-mail is intended for the sole use of the intended recipient and may contain
privileged, sensitive, or protected health information. If you are not the intended recipient, be advised
that the unauthorized use, disclosure, copying, distribution, or action taken in reliance on the contents of
this communication is prohibited. if you have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender via
telephone or return e-mail and immediately delete this e-mail."




Andrea Cinadr

From: Andrea Cinadr

Sent: Friday, February 27, 2026 10:30 AM
To: Brianna Fox

Subject: RE: Invoices

Thank you very much for understanding!

Andrea Cinadr

Health Commissioner

Galion City Health Department
113 Harding Way East

Phone: 419-468-1075 ext. 1265
Cell: 419-989-3189

Fax: 419-468-8618

oo
galion city

Confidentiality Notice: "This e-mail is intended for the sole use of the intended recipient and may contain
privileged, sensitive, or protected health information. If you are not the intended recipient, be advised
that the unauthorized use, disclosure, copying, distribution, or action taken in reliance on the contents of
this communication is prohibited. if you have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender via
telephone or return e-mail and immediately delete this e-mail."

From: Brianna Fox <BFox@esconsult.net>

Sent: Friday, February 27, 2026 10:29 AM

To: Andrea Cinadr <andrea.cinadr@galionhealth.org>
Subject: Re: Invoices

Hi Andrea,

Happy Friday! No worries, we are crediting the 2022 invoices. Thank you for your payment for the remaining
invoices.

| hope you have a nice weekend!

Best Regards,
Bri Fox

PROCUREMENT AND REVENUE COORDINATOR
ES|CONSULTING, INC

419.756.1869
3849 PARK AVENUE WEST, ONTARIO, OH 44903



